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So it was, that while they were there, the days were completed for her to be 
delivered. And she brought forth her firstborn Son, and wrapped Him in 
swaddling cloths, and laid Him in a manger, because there was no room for 
them in the inn. Luke 2:6-7 NKJV 
 
But when the fullness of the time had come, God sent forth His Son, born of a 
woman, born under the law, to redeem those who were under the law, that we 
might receive the adoption as sons. Galatians 4:4-5 NKJV 
 
Adoption of Sons is one word in Greek  means “Sonship”. Jesus was born to 
die. Sin has been transferred down through the generations in the blood. 
Mary’s blood was contaminated with sin. 
 
For all have sinned and fall short of the glory of God, 

NKJV 23:3 Romans  
 
For the life of the flesh is in the blood, and I have given it to you upon the altar 
to make atonement for your souls; for it is the blood that makes atonement for 
the soul. Leviticus 17:11 NKJV 
 
And rose up and thrust Him out of the city; and they led Him to the brow of 
the hill on which their city was built, that they might throw Him down over 
the cliff. Then passing through the midst of them, He went His way. Luke 
4:29-30 NKJV 
 
Then they took up stones to throw at Him; but Jesus hid Himself and went out 
of the temple, going through the midst of them, and so passed by. John 8:59 
NKJV 
 
Death came because of sin and because Jesus had sin death couldn’t touch 
Him. 
 
For He made Him who knew no sin to be sin for us, that we might become the 
righteousness of God in Him. II Corinthians 5:21 NKJV 



 
Who did no sin, neither was guile found in his mouth: 

KJV 22:2 1 Peter  
 
And you know that He was manifested to take away our sins, and in Him there 
is no sin.  I John 3:5 NKJV 
 
The next day John saw Jesus coming toward him, and said, “Behold! The Lamb 
of God who takes away the sin of the world!  John 1:29 NKJV 
 
And she brought forth her firstborn Son, and wrapped Him in swaddling 
cloths, and laid Him in a manger, because there was no room for them in the 
inn. Luke 2:7 NKJV 
 
The manger was like a hewn out of a stone and His tomb looked just like that. 
 
 For the wages of sin is death, but the gift of God is eternal life in Christ Jesus 
our Lord. Romans 6:23 NKJV 
 
The compensation for sin was death. 
 
Inasmuch then as the children have partaken of flesh and blood, He Himself 
likewise shared in the same, that through death He might destroy him who 
had the power of death, that is, the devil, and release those who through fear 
of death were all their lifetime subject to bondage.  Hebrews 2:14-15 NKJV 
 
For all have sinned and fall short of the glory of God, 

NKJV 23:3 Romans  
 
And I will put enmity Between you and the woman, And between your seed 
and her Seed; He shall bruise your head, And you shall bruise His heel. 

NKJV 15:3 Genesis  
 
This is a prophecy of the virgin birth. Bruise is Hebrew word meaning “crush”. 
 
For if when we were enemies we were reconciled to God through the death of 
His Son, much more, having been reconciled, we shall be saved by His life. 

NKJV 10:5 Romans  
 



Therefore, just as through one man sin entered the world, and death through 
sin, and thus death spread to all men, because all sinned— (For until the law 
sin was in the world, but sin is not imputed when there is no law. Nevertheless 
death reigned from Adam to Moses, even over those who had not sinned 
according to the likeness of the transgression of Adam, who is a type of Him 
who was to come. Romans 5:12-14 NKJV 
 
For God so loved the world that He gave His only begotten Son, that whoever 
believes in Him should not perish but have everlasting life. John 3:16 NKJV 
 
and of the tree of knowledge of good and evil, thou dost not eat of it, for in the 
day of thine eating of it — dying thou dost die.  Genesis 2:17 YLT98 
 
The last enemy that will be destroyed is death.  I Corinthians 15:26 NKJV 
 


